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Title 5—DEPARTMENT OF 
ELEMENTARY AND  

SECONDARY EDUCATION 
Division 25—Office of Childhood 

Chapter 300—License-Exempt Child  
Care Facilities 

5 CSR 25-300.010 Definitions Relating to 
Child Care Facilities 

PURPOSE: This rule defines the terms used 
throughout this chapter. 

(1) The following definitions shall be used in 
interpreting the rules of this chapter:  

(A) Adult is an individual eighteen (18) 
years of age or older;  

(B) Caregiver is the facility director or 
other child care staff whether they are paid or 
volunteering;  

(C) Child care is care of a child away from 
his/her own home for any part of the twenty-
four- (24-) hour day for compensation or oth-
erwise. Child care is a voluntary supplement 
to parental responsibility for the child’s pro-
tection, development, and supervision;  

(D) Child care provider or provider is the 
person(s) having the following responsibili-
ties: 

1. Ultimate responsibility for making 
and implementing decisions regarding the 
operation of the facility; and  

2. Ultimate financial control of the oper-
ation of the facility; 

(E) Child care staff member is a child care 
provider; persons employed by the child care 
provider for compensation, including con-
tract employees or self-employed individuals; 
individuals or volunteers whose activities 
involve the care or supervision of children for 
a child care provider or unsupervised access 
to children who are cared for or supervised 
by a child care provider; individuals residing 
in a family child care home who are eighteen 
(18) years of age or older; and individuals 
residing in a family child care home who are 
under eighteen (18) years of age and have 
been certified as an adult for the commission 
of an offense; 

(F) Department is the Missouri Department 
of Elementary and Secondary Education;  

(G) Group size is the maximum number of 
children assigned to a specific staff member 
or group of staff members, occupying an 
individual classroom or well-defined physical 
space within a large room; 

(H) Homeless children and youths— 
1. Are individuals who lack a fixed, reg-

ular, and adequate nighttime residence; and  
2. Include: 

A. Children and youths who are shar-
ing the housing of other persons due to loss 

of housing, economic hardship, or a similar 
reason; are living in motels, hotels, trailer 
parks, or camping grounds due to the lack of 
alternative adequate accommodations; are 
living in emergency or transitional shelters; 
or are abandoned in hospitals; 

B. Children and youths who have a 
primary nighttime residence that is a public 
or private place not designed for or ordinari-
ly used as a regular sleeping accommodation 
for human beings; 

C. Children and youths who are living 
in cars, parks, public spaces, abandoned 
buildings, substandard housing, bus or train 
stations, or similar settings; and 

D. Migratory children who qualify as 
homeless because the children are living in 
the circumstances described above; 

(I) Infant is a child less than twelve (12) 
months of age;  

(J) Kindergarten is a children’s education-
al program offered to prepare children for the 
first grade;  

(K) License-exempt child care facility or 
facility is a nursery school not operated by a 
religious organization or child care main-
tained or operated under the exclusive control 
of a religious organization, not including reli-
gious organization academic preschools or 
kindergartens;  

(L) Local public health agency is an entity 
that enforces local public health codes and 
ordinances and provides other services relat-
ed to public health;  

(M) Nursery school is an educational pro-
gram for preschool-age children that is oper-
ated for no more than four (4) hours per child 
per day; 

(N) Parent means a child’s biological par-
ent whose parental rights have not been ter-
minated, a step-parent, an adoptive parent, a 
legal guardian, a caretaker relative, or other 
person standing in loco parentis for the child; 

(O) Premises is a house(s), dwelling(s), or 
building(s) and the adjoining land of a 
license-exempt child care facility; 

(P) Preschool-age child is a child two 
through five (2-5) years of age not enrolled in 
kindergarten;   

(Q) Religious organization is— 
1. A church, synagogue, or mosque; 
2. An entity that qualifies for federal tax 

exemption status as a not-for-profit religious 
organization under Section 501(c)(3) of the 
Internal Revenue Code; or  

3. An entity whose real estate on which 
the child care facility is located is exempt 
from taxation because it is used for religious 
purposes; 

(R) Religious organization academic 
preschool or kindergarten is a child care pro-
gram provided exclusively for four- (4-) and 

five- (5-)-year old children that is maintained 
or operated under the exclusive control of a 
religious organization; 

(S) School-age child is a child five (5) 
years of age or older who is enrolled in 
kindergarten or above;  

(T) Staff/child ratio is the number of care-
givers required in relation to the number of 
children in care;   

(U) Toddler is a child twelve to twenty-
four (12-24) months of age; and  

(V) Variance is approval by the department 
for a provider not to be required to meet a 
specific requirement of the rules of this chap-
ter. 

AUTHORITY: section 161.092, RSMo 2016, 
and section 210.252, RSMo Supp. 2021.* 
This rule was previously filed as 19 CSR 40-
60.010. Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, 
effective July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 
30-60.010 July 30, 1998. Emergency amend-
ment filed March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 
2000, expired Sept. 6. 2000. Amended: Filed 
March 1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. 
Moved to 5 CSR 25-300.010, effective Aug. 
30, 2021. Amended: Filed Oct. 6, 2021, effec-
tive May 30, 2022. 

*Original authority: 161.092, RSMo 1963, amended 
1973, 2002, 2003, 2013, 2014, and 210.252, RSMo 1993, 
amended 1999, 2019, 2020, 2021. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.020 Application for Annual 
Fire Safety and Health and Sanitation 
Inspections and Inspection Procedures 

PURPOSE: This rule establishes how a facil-
ity director may apply for annual fire safety 
and health and sanitation inspections and 
how the inspections are conducted. 

PUBLISHER’S NOTE:  The secretary of state 
has determined that the publication of the 
entire text of the material which is incorpo-
rated by reference as a portion of this rule 
would be unduly cumbersome or expensive.   
This material as incorporated by reference in 
this rule shall be maintained by the agency at 
its headquarters and shall be made available 
to the public for inspection and copying at no 
more than the actual cost of reproduction. 
This note applies only to the reference mate-
rial. The entire text of the rule is printed 
here. 

(1) The director of each facility shall apply to 
the Department of Health and Senior 
Services for an annual fire safety inspection 
by the state fire marshal or his/her designee, 
and for a health and sanitation inspection by 
the department or officials of a local health 
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department. Religious organization academic 
preschools are not required to apply for annu-
al fire and safety inspections or the health 
and sanitation inspections. 

(2) Facility inspections shall be conducted 
during normal business hours and may be 
unannounced. The facility director shall be 
given a copy of the completed inspection 
form.  

(3) The agency, organization, or person that 
owns the facility and the person delegated as 
director of the facility shall be identified on 
the application for a fire safety and a health 
and sanitation inspection.  

(4) When a facility is incorporated, the chair-
person of the board of directors, or the per-
son delegated as director of the facility, shall 
sign the application for a fire safety and a 
health and sanitation inspection. 

(5) If there is a change of ownership of the 
facility, the new owner(s) or the facility direc-
tor shall request a fire safety inspection and a 
health and sanitation inspection. 

(6) Notice of Parental Responsibility. 
(A) Child care facilities operated by a reli-

gious organization shall keep on file a notice 
of parental responsibility, as required by sec-
tion 210.254, RSMo, at least five (5) days 
prior to starting operation. 

(B) A child care facility operated by a 
religious organization shall use the Notice 
of Parental Responsibility form, revised 
2018 and incorporated by reference in this 
rule, as published by the Missouri 
Department of Health and Senior Services, 
PO Box 570, Jefferson City, MO 65102-
0570 and available by the department at 
https://health.mo.gov/safety/childcare/forms
.php. This rule does not incorporate any sub-
sequent amendments or additions. 

(C) A child care facility operated by a reli-
gious organization shall provide the parent or 
guardian enrolling the child two (2) copies of 
the Notice of Parental Responsibility form for 
the enrolling parent to acknowledge, by sig-
nature, having read and accepted the infor-
mation. One (1) copy shall be kept by the 
parent or guardian and the other copy shall be 
retained in the child’s record at the facility. 

(D) A child care facility operated by a reli-
gious organization shall file the Notice of 
Parental Responsibility form with the depart-
ment annually during the month of August. 

AUTHORITY: sections 210.221.1(3) and 
210.252.5, RSMo 2016, and sections 210.254 
and 210.1080, RSMo Supp. 2018.* This rule 
was previously filed as 19 CSR 40-60.020. 

Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, effective 
July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 30-60.020 
July 30, 1998. Emergency amendment filed 
March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 2000, 
expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed March 
1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. Emergency 
amendment filed Feb. 15, 2019, effective Feb. 
25, 2019, expired Aug. 23, 2019. Amended: 
Filed Feb. 15, 2019, effective Aug. 30, 2019. 
Moved to 5 CSR 25-300.020, effective Aug. 
30, 2021. 

*Original authority: 210.221, RSMo 1949, amended 1955, 
1987, 1993, 1995, 1999, 2015; 210.252, RSMo 1993, 
amended 1999; 210.254, RSMo 1993, amended 1999, 
2014, 2018; and 210.1080, RSMo 2018. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.030 Local Inspections 
(Rescinded May 30, 2022) 

AUTHORITY: sections 210.221.1(3) and 
210.252.5, RSMo Supp. 1999. This rule was 
previously filed as 19 CSR 40-60.030. 
Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, effective 
July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 30-60.030 
July 30, 1998. Emergency amendment filed 
March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 2000, 
expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed March 
1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. Moved to 5 
CSR 25-300.030, effective Aug. 30, 2021. 
Rescinded: Filed Oct. 6, 2021, effective May 
30, 2022. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.040 Staffing Requirements 

PURPOSE: This rule establishes staffing 
requirements for license-exempt facilities. 

(1) Supervision and basic care shall be pro-
vided at all license-exempt facilities. 

(2) All caregivers shall review the rules of 
this chapter. 

(3) Nursery schools shall have on file quali-
fying background screening results for child 
care staff members in accordance with 19 
CSR 30-63.020 General Requirements. 

(4) Facilities operated by a religious organiza-
tion and that receive federal funds for provid-
ing care for children shall have on file quali-
fying background screening results for child 
care staff members in accordance with 19 
CSR 30-63.020 General Requirements. 

(5) Child care staff members of nursery 
schools or facilities operated by a religious 
organization and that receive federal funds 
for providing care for children with disquali-
fying background screening results are pro-
hibited from being on the premises during 

child care hours in accordance with 19 CSR 
30-63.020 General Requirements. 

(6) Criminal background checks shall be 
completed every five (5) years for child care 
staff members of nursery schools and facili-
ties operated by a religious organization and 
that receive federal funds for providing care 
for children in accordance with 19 CSR 30-
63.020 General Requirements. 

(7) A check of the Family Care Safety 
Registry shall be conducted for all child care 
staff members of nursery schools every two 
(2) years. 

(8) Background screening information 
received by the provider shall be retained in 
the individual’s file in a confidential manner 
and made available for review when request-
ed by the department. 

AUTHORITY: sections 210.221.1(3) and 
210.252.5, RSMo 2016, and section 210.1080, 
RSMo Supp. 2018.* This rule was previously 
filed as 19 CSR 40-60.050. Original rule 
filed Dec. 1, 1994, effective July 30, 1995. 
Changed to 19 CSR 30-60.050 July 30, 1998. 
Emergency amendment filed March 1, 2000, 
effective March 11, 2000, expired Sept. 6, 
2000. Amended: Filed March 1, 2000, effec-
tive Aug. 30, 2000. Emergency amendment 
filed Feb. 15, 2019, effective Feb. 25, 2019, 
expired Aug. 23, 2019. Amended: Filed Feb. 
15, 2019, effective Aug. 30, 2019. Moved to 5 
CSR 25-300.040, effective Aug. 30, 2021. 

*Original authority: 210.221, RSMo 1949, amended 1955, 
1987, 1993, 1995, 1999, 2015; 210.252, RSMo 1993, 
amended 1999; and 210.1080, RSMo 2018. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.050 Health Requirements 

PURPOSE: This rule establishes health 
requirements for child care providers and 
children in license-exempt child care facili-
ties. 

(1) Facility staff shall meet the following 
health requirements:  

(A) The director or other caregiver shall 
report to the local health department when 
any child in a facility is suspected of having a 
reportable communicable disease listed in 19 
CSR 20-20.020(1)–(5). In the event of an 
unusual outbreak of a reportable communica-
ble disease, caregivers shall implement con-
trol measures recommended by the depart-
ment or local health department;  

(B) Caregivers shall use proper handwash-
ing techniques with soap and warm, running 
water after toileting, after assisting a child 
with toileting, after diapering a child, and at 
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other times as needed. Good hygiene prac-
tices shall be followed during food prepara-
tion. These practices include, but are not lim-
ited to, washing hands properly after smok-
ing, eating, drinking, using the restroom, 
after touching raw food products and before 
preparing and serving food. Hands shall be 
dried with single-service towels. Caregivers 
shall teach and see that children wash their 
hands at appropriate times: before eating, 
after toileting and as needed when hands are 
soiled;  

(C) Caregivers shall not work when ill and 
likely to transmit an illness that might endan-
ger the health or well-being of children. This 
may include symptoms such as fever, cough-
ing, upper respiratory infection, vomiting or 
diarrhea;  

(D) All caregivers working in a facility 
during child care hours shall be in good 
health. They shall have a physical assess-
ment, including a tuberculosis status assess-
ment by a licensed physician or registered 
professional nurse. A physical assessment 
report, signed by a licensed physician or reg-
istered professional nurse, shall be on file at 
the time of employment or within thirty (30) 
days following employment.  

1. Physical assessment reports shall be 
completed not more than twelve (12) months 
before beginning work in the facility. The 
reports may be transferred to another facility 
for future employment.  

2. The facility may use the department’s 
physical assessment form, MO 580-1879 (6-
94), or the facility may use its own form if it 
contains all the information on the depart-
ment’s form. 

3. After the initial physical assessment, 
all caregivers working in a facility during 
child care hours shall be tested for tuberculo-
sis at least every two (2) years. Caregivers 
with previously positive tuberculin tests shall 
be under the management of a physician; and 

(E) No person shall smoke or use tobacco 
products in any area of a child care facility 
while children are in care. 

(2) Within thirty (30) days following the 
admission of an infant, toddler or preschool 
child, a physical assessment report signed by 
a licensed physician or registered profession-
al nurse shall be on file at the facility. The 
facility may use the department’s physical 
assessment form, MO 580-1878 (6-94), or 
the facility may use its own form if it contains 
all the information on the department’s form. 
The report shall have been completed not 
more than twelve (12) months before admis-
sion. 

(3) Child care facilities shall meet immuniza-

tion requirements for children as defined by 
section 210.003, RSMo. 

(4) A parent of a school-age child shall pro-
vide a statement at the time of enrollment 
indicating the child’s health history, any cur-
rent health problems and any restrictions nec-
essary for the child’s care.  

(5) Each child shall be observed for conta-
gious diseases and other signs of illness on 
arrival and throughout each day.  

(6) A parent or guardian shall be contacted 
when signs of illness are observed.  

(7) When a child exhibits any of the follow-
ing in subsections (7)(A)–(O) of this rule, the 
parent(s) shall be contacted and the child 
shall be sent home. Parental contact shall be 
recorded and filed in the child’s records. 
Symptoms that require parental contact and 
sending a child home are— 

(A) More than one (1) abnormally loose 
stool;  

(B) Red or blue in the face or makes high-
pitched croupy or whooping sounds after 
coughing;  

(C) Difficult or rapid breathing—especial-
ly important in infants under six (6) months 
of age;  

(D) Yellowish skin or eyes;  
(E) Tears, redness of eyelid lining or irrita-

tion, followed by swelling or discharge of 
pus;  

(F) Unusual spots or rashes;  
(G) Sore throat or swallowing difficulty;  
(H) An infected skin patch—crusty, bright 

yellow, dry or gummy areas of the skin;  
(I) Unusually dark, tea-colored urine;  
(J) Gray or white stool;  
(K) Fever over one hundred one degrees 

Fahrenheit (101°F) by mouth or one hundred 
degrees Fahrenheit (100°F) under the arm;  

(L) Headache and stiff neck;  
(M) Vomiting more than once;  
(N) A child is in the contagious period of 

a disease; or  
(O) Severe itching of the body or scalp or 

scratching of the scalp which may be symp-
toms of lice or scabies. 

(8) An ill child shall be kept isolated from the 
other children and a caregiver shall be in 
close proximity to the child until a parent 
arrives. Close proximity means that a care-
giver is close enough to hear any sounds a 
child might make that indicate a need for 
assistance.  

(9) A parent of each child shall be notified 
when any reportable communicable disease 

in 19 CSR 20-20.020(1)–(5) occurs in the 
facility.  

(10) Providers are not required to administer 
medication, but may if they choose.  

(A) All medication shall be given to a child 
only with the dated, written permission of a 
parent, stating the length of time the medica-
tion may be given.  

(B) Prescription and nonprescription med-
ication shall be in the original container and 
labeled with the child’s name, instructions for 
administration, including the times and 
amounts for dosages, and the physician’s 
name. Sample medication provided by a 
physician may be used.  

(C) All medication shall be stored out of 
reach of children or in a locked container.  

(D) Medication shall be returned to storage 
immediately after use.  

(E) Medication needing refrigeration shall 
be kept in the refrigerator in a container sep-
arate from food.  

(F) Unused medication shall be returned to 
the parent or disposed of immediately after it 
is no longer needed.  

(G) The date and time(s) of administration, 
the name of the individual giving the medica-
tion and the quantity of medication given 
shall be recorded promptly after administra-
tion. This form shall be filed in the child’s 
record after the medication is no longer nec-
essary. 

(11) In case of an accident or injury to a 
child, the provider shall notify a parent 
immediately. If a child requires emergency 
medical care, a parent’s prior written instruc-
tions shall be followed. A form shall be com-
pleted indicating the circumstances and the 
date and time of the injury. The form shall be  
signed by the caregiver and his/her supervi-
sor. A copy of the form shall be given to the 
parent the day of the accident or injury and 
necessary explanations shall be given. The 
form shall be filed in the child’s record. 

AUTHORITY: sections 210.221.1(3) and 
210.252.5, RSMo Supp. 1999.* This rule was 
previously filed as 19 CSR 40-60.060. 
Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, effective 
July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 30-60.060 
July 30, 1998. Emergency amendment filed 
March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 2000, 
expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed March 
1, 2000, effective August 30, 2000. Moved to 
5 CSR 25-300.050, effective Aug. 30, 2021. 

*Original authority: 210.221, RSMo 1949, amended 1955, 
1987, 1993, 1995, 1999; 210.252, RSMo 1993, amended 
1999. 
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5 CSR 25-300.060 Responsibilities of 
Caregivers 

PURPOSE: This rule establishes the respon-
sibilities of caregivers in license-exempt facil-
ities. 

(1) The responsibilities of caregivers are— 
(A) Children shall not be left without adult 

supervision.  
1. A caregiver shall personally admit 

each child upon arrival and personally dis-
miss each child upon departure. Children 
shall be dismissed only to a parent, guardian, 
legal custodian, or to individuals approved by 
a parent, guardian or legal custodian.  

2. A caregiver shall remain in the room 
with infants, preschool and school-age chil-
dren while the children are napping and shall 
be able to see and hear the children if they 
have difficulty during napping or when they 
awaken.  

3. Caregivers shall be alert to various 
needs of each child such as thirst, hunger, 
diaper change, aggression by other children 
and need for attention;  

(B) Facility directors, with the exception of 
directors in facilities operated by religious 
organizations, shall establish a written disci-
pline plan that includes simple, understand-
able rules for children’s behavior.  

1. Expectations for a child’s behavior 
shall be appropriate for the developmental 
level of the child and explained to the child.  

2. Only constructive, age-appropriate 
methods of discipline that help children 
develop self-control and assume responsibili-
ty for their own actions shall be used. 

3. Physical punishment including, but 
not limited to, spanking, slapping, shaking, 
biting or pulling hair is prohibited.  

4. Any discipline technique that is 
humiliating, threatening or frightening to 
children is prohibited. Children shall not be 
shamed, ridiculed or spoken to harshly, abu-
sively or with profanity.  

5. Punishment or threat of punishment 
shall not be associated with food, rest, toilet-
ing accidents or toilet training.  

6. Children shall not be placed in a clos-
et, a locked or unlighted room, or any other 
frightening place.  

7. Children shall not be permitted to 
intimidate or harm others, harm themselves 
or destroy property;  

(C) Facility directors, with the exception of 
directors in facilities operated by religious 
organizations, shall establish a daily schedule 
of activities for all children in care. The 
schedule shall include the following:  

1. A total of at least one (1) hour of out-
door play for children in full-day attendance, 

unless prevented by weather extremes or 
medical reasons;  

2. Toileting and handwashing times;  
3. Regular snack and meal times, with 

infants being fed according to the individual-
ized feeding schedule established by a parent; 
and  

4. A supervised nap or rest period for 
preschool children after the noon meal, with 
infants allowed to remain in bed a maximum 
of thirty (30) minutes after awakening. 
Toddlers shall be taken out of bed for other 
activities when they awaken; 

(D) Facility directors shall not allow ani-
mals which may pose a threat to the health or 
safety of children on the premises or the ani-
mals shall be penned securely in an area that 
is inaccessible to children;  

(E) A caregiver shall supervise children in 
the bathroom;  

(F) Caregivers shall meet the following 
requirements regarding diapering areas:  

1. A safe, waterproof and washable dia-
pering surface shall be used for changing dia-
pers. The diapering area shall be located 
within or adjacent to the infant/toddler group 
so the caregiver using the diapering surface 
can maintain supervision of his/her group of 
children at all times;  

2. One (1) diapering surface shall be 
provided for every group of eight (8) 
infants/toddlers and one (1) diapering surface 
shall be provided for every group of sixteen 
(16) two (2)-year-old children in the 
infant/toddler unit;  

3. A diapering surface shall be available 
in the preschool unit if children who are not 
toilet trained are accepted;  

4. Children shall be attended at all times 
while on the diapering surface;  

5. No effort shall be made to toilet train 
a child until the parent and caregiver agree on 
when to begin; and  

6. Extra clothing shall be available for 
children in case they accidentally soil them-
selves;  

(G) If meals are served, the facility direc-
tor is responsible for assuring that the chil-
dren’s diets are planned according to recog-
nized nutrition standards; 

(H) In facilities providing care for less than 
four (4) hours per day or less than twenty 
(20) hours per week, children may bring sack 
lunches; and 

(I) Caregivers shall meet the following 
requirements for kitchens:  

1. Kitchens shall not be used for chil-
dren’s play activities unless the activities are 
part of a learning program and the children 
are supervised by adults;  

2. Kitchens shall not be used for nap-
ping or as passageways for children;  

3. Kitchens shall be separated from all 
other areas by walls or partitions at least thir-
ty-six inches (36") high; and 

4. Animals which may pose a threat to 
children shall not be permitted on the premis-
es or shall be located in an area that is inac-
cessible to the children. Animals shall not be 
permitted in food preparation and storage 
areas.  

AUTHORITY: sections 210.221.1(3) and 
210.252.5, RSMo Supp. 1999.* This rule was 
previously filed as 19 CSR 40-60.070. 
Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, effective 
July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 30-60.070 
July 30, 1998. Emergency amendment filed 
March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 2000, 
expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed March 
1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. Moved to 5 
CSR 25-300.060, effective Aug. 30, 2021. 

*Original authority: 210.221, RSMo 1949, amended 1955, 
1987, 1993, 1995, 1999; 210.252, RSMo 1993, amended 
1999. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.070 Fire Safety Require-
ments 

PURPOSE: This rule establishes the fire safe-
ty requirements for all license-exempt child 
care facilities. 

(1) These general fire safety requirements 
shall be followed at all facilities:  

(A) At least one (1) portable, operable 
flashlight shall be accessible to staff;  

(B) All flammable materials shall be stored 
properly and accessible only to authorized 
persons;  

(C) House numbers shall be plainly visible 
from the street, or the location of the facility 
shall be made known to the local fire depart-
ment;  

(D) If child care is provided after dark, 
emergency lighting with a battery back-up 
shall be required;  

(E) Facilities beginning operation after 
July 30, 1995, shall have a minimum ceiling 
height of seven feet (7') in all areas used for 
child care; and  

(F) Providers shall notify the nearest fire 
department when the facility begins opera-
tion. 

(2) These requirements for exits and doors 
shall be followed at all facilities:  

(A) Each floor occupied by children shall 
have no less than two (2) exits remote from 
each other. Exit doors shall swing in the 
direction of exit travel and shall lead directly, 
or through an enclosed fire-resistant stairway, 
to the outside. This includes basement areas;  
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(B) Children shall not be permitted to sleep 
above the second floor;  

(C) Doors in a means of egress shall swing 
in the direction of exit travel. This does not 
apply to facilities caring for ten (10) or less 
children;  

(D) Outside doors shall not be locked to 
prevent exit while the building is occupied;  

(E) Every bathroom door lock or bathroom 
stall door shall be designed to permit opening 
from the outside in an emergency. All closet 
latches shall allow children to open the doors 
from the inside; and  

(F) Facilities shall have smokestop parti-
tions with a one- (1-) hour fire resistant rat-
ing between each floor. All doors providing 
separation between floors shall have a forty-
five- (45-) minute fire resistant rating with an 
attached self-closing device. This does not 
apply to facilities caring for ten (10) or fewer 
children. 

(3) These requirements for detection and 
extinguishment systems shall be followed at 
all facilities:  

(A) Each facility caring for more than ten 
(10), but less than fifty (50) children at one 
(1) time shall have— 

1. Manual pull stations by every exit or 
where designated by the fire inspector. They 
shall be connected to an alarm that is audible 
throughout the facility. One- (1-) room facili-
ties that exit directly to the outside are not 
subject to this requirement; and  

2. At least one (1) Underwriter’s 
Laboratory (UL) or Factory Mutual (FM)-
approved individual home-type detector shall 
be located on each floor and in each haz-
ardous area. The number and location of 
detectors shall be determined by the fire 
inspector. Detectors shall be tested monthly 
and batteries changed as needed. A record 
shall be kept of the dates of testing and 
changing of batteries;  

(B) Facilities caring for fifty (50) or more 
children at one (1) time shall have a full-cov-
erage electrical fire alarm system with battery 
back-up, smoke detectors, heat sensors, and 
pull stations. All equipment shall be UL- or 
FM-certified;  

(C) Facilities caring for more than one 
hundred (100) children at one (1) time shall 
have a fire alarm that is transmitted to the 
local fire department or official authority;  

(D) Commercial stoves, commercial cook-
ing ranges, and deep fryers shall be equipped 
with a range hood and extinguishing system 
with an automatic cutoff of fuel supply, and 
an exhaust system;  

(E) A portable five (5) pound, 2A10BC 
fire extinguisher shall be located near the 
kitchen. The location shall be at the discre-

tion of the fire inspector. Additional extin-
guishers may be required by the fire inspec-
tor; and  

(F) Janitor closets, maintenance shops, and 
boiler or furnace rooms in child care space 
shall be separated from other parts of the 
building with construction having at least a 
one- (1-) hour fire resistant rating. The open-
ing shall have solid core doors to close off the 
area. 

(4) Heating equipment shall be installed with 
permanent connections and proper ventila-
tion.  

(A) Space heaters, floor furnaces, wood 
burning stoves, and fireplaces shall have a 
noncombustible guard or partition to prevent 
children from touching or tampering with 
them.  

(B) Unvented gas and oil heaters shall not 
be used.  

(C) All gas and electrical heating equip-
ment shall be equipped with thermostatic 
controls. All hot water heaters shall have a 
temperature/pressure relief valve, be vented 
properly, and equipped with thermostatic 
controls. The drain line on the pressure relief 
valve shall extend to approximately six inch-
es (6") above the floor.  

(D) Only commercially manufactured heat-
ing equipment shall be used. 

(5) Fire and tornado drills shall be conducted 
at least every three (3) months and shall 
include all children in care. Unscheduled 
drills shall be held at the discretion of the 
state fire marshal or department. Each fire 
drill shall include a complete evacuation of 
all persons from the building.  

(A) An emergency plan for fires and torna-
does shall be posted conspicuously and shall 
include the route for the drills and special 
instructions for nonambulatory infants and 
children.  

(B) A written record shall be kept of the 
dates and types of drills conducted. 

(6) Fire safety inspections of license-exempt 
facilities may be delegated to local fire dis-
tricts if the standards employed for inspec-
tions are equivalent to those in this rule. 

AUTHORITY: section 161.092, RSMo 2016, 
and section 210.252, RSMo Supp. 2021.* 
This rule was previously filed as 19 CSR 40-
60.080. Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, 
effective July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 
30-60.080 July 30, 1998. Emergency amend-
ment filed March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 
2000, expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed 
March 1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. 
Moved to 5 CSR 25-300.070, effective Aug. 
30, 2021. Amended: Filed Oct. 6, 2021, effec-

tive May 30, 2022. 

*Original authority: 161.092, RSMo 1963, amended 
1973, 2002, 2003, 2013, 2014, and 210.252, RSMo 1993, 
amended 1999, 2019, 2020, 2021. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.080 Sanitation Require-
ments 

PURPOSE: This rule establishes the require-
ments for maintaining proper sanitation in 
license-exempt child care facilities. 

(1) The premises of facilities shall be clean 
and free of unsanitary conditions and observ-
able insects, spiders, and rodents.  

(A) Floors in bathrooms and kitchens shall 
be clean. Carpet shall not be used in bath-
rooms. 

(B) Infant and toddler toys shall be kept 
clean and shall be sanitized after any contact 
with body fluids.  

(C) Sanitizers shall be used in appropriate 
concentrations.  

(D) If toothbrushes, combs, hairbrushes, 
or other personal care items are used, they 
shall be individually air-dried and labeled 
with each child’s name.  

(2) Bathrooms shall meet the following 
requirements:  

(A) Toilets, urinals, and handwashing sinks 
shall be clean and odor free;  

(B) Toilet and handwashing facilities shall 
be in working order and convenient for the 
children’s use;  

(C) Paper towels or a hot-air dryer that is 
installed and maintained properly, soap and 
toilet paper shall be provided and accessible 
so the children can reach them without assis-
tance;  

(D) Potty chairs shall be located in the 
bathroom and shall be emptied, cleaned, and 
sanitized after each use; and  

(E) Bathrooms shall be enclosed with full 
walls and solid doors.  

(3) Diapering areas shall meet the following 
requirements:  

(A) Diapering supplies and a handwashing 
sink with warm, running water shall be in a 
location that allows the caregiver to maintain 
supervision of the children in care at all 
times;  

(B) Disposable tissues or wipes shall be 
used to clean the child at each time of dia-
pering. Any diapering creams, powders, or 
other products applied at the time of diaper-
ing shall be approved or provided by the par-
ent(s) and labeled with the child’s name;  

(C) The diapering surface, after each use, 
shall be cleaned and sanitized with a sanitiz-
er approved by the department;  



(D) Diapers and wet clothing shall be 
changed promptly;  

(E) Wet or soiled disposable diapers shall 
be placed in an airtight disposal container 
located in the diaper change area and dis-
carded daily. If cloth diapers are used, they 
shall be stored in airtight plastic bags and 
removed from the building daily; and  

(F) The diapering and handwashing areas 
shall be separate from food service areas and 
food-related materials. 

(4) Kitchens and meals shall meet the follow-
ing requirements:  

(A) A kitchen shall be required for meal 
preparation if a provider serves meals, unless 
meals are catered from a source approved by 
a state or local health department;  

(B) A kitchen used for meal preparation 
shall have sufficient equipment to serve the 
number of children in care. Equipment shall 
include a stove, sink, hot and cold running 
water, a refrigerator, and storage space for 
food, dishes, and cooking utensils;  

(C) If meals are catered, a sink with hot 
and cold running water, a refrigerator, and 
storage space shall be provided; and  

(D) Floors shall be a hard, smooth surface, 
easily cleanable and in good repair. Facilities 
caring for ten (10) or less children may use 
carpet.  

(5) Food equipment and utensils shall meet 
the following requirements:  

(A) All food equipment, utensils, and food 
preparation surfaces shall be cleaned proper-
ly and sanitized with a sanitizer approved by 
the department;  

(B) Kitchen equipment that produces 
excessive heat and moisture shall be vented 
properly;  

(C) If a mechanical dishwasher is used, it 
shall have the capacity to sanitize all dishes 
and utensils used in meal preparation;  

(D) Facilities caring for more than twenty 
(20) children shall use a three- (3-) vat sink; 
single-service utensils, cups, and plates in 
conjunction with the sink; or a commercial 
dishwasher. Facilities caring for twenty (20) 
children or less may use a two- (2-) vat sink 
and a container large enough to sanitize the 
largest utensil used;  

(E) Sinks shall be equipped with hot and 
cold running water and an area for draining 
dishes. Approved dishwashing methods shall 
be used;  

(F) Facilities caring for more than twenty 
(20) children shall have separate handwashing 
sinks in food preparation areas equipped with 
hot and cold running water, hand cleanser, 
and paper towels;  

(G) Food preparation areas shall have ade-

quate lighting;  
(H) An accurate thermometer shall be 

located in each refrigerator. Each refrigerator 
shall be maintained at a temperature of forty-
one degrees Fahrenheit (41°F) or less;  

(I) Freezers shall keep foods in a frozen 
solid state; and  

(J) A metal stem bayonet-type thermome-
ter for checking food temperatures shall be 
used to check temperatures.  

(6) Nonpublic water systems shall meet the 
requirements of section 256.600, RSMo.  

(A) Public water systems shall meet the 
requirements of sections 640.010 and 
640.140, RSMo.  

(B) All water systems shall be free of 
cross-connections and threaded faucets shall 
have a backflow preventive device.  

(7) Sewage systems shall be designed for the 
capacity of the facility, operate properly, be 
nuisance free, and meet applicable laws and 
rules of the department and the Department 
of Natural Resources.  

(8) Adequate refuse disposal and storage shall 
be provided. A sufficient number of nonab-
sorbent containers and lids shall be available.  

(9) Providers shall observe the following food 
protection practices:  

(A) Cross-contamination of raw and 
cooked foods is prohibited. Hands shall not 
be washed in equipment washing vats;  

(B) Home-canned foods shall not be used;  
(C) All food shall be from an approved and 

inspected source, except fresh or frozen fruits 
and vegetables;  

(D) All food shall be in sound condition;  
(E) Catered food shall be from a caterer 

that is inspected and approved by a state or 
local health department and shall be received 
at the facility meeting all temperature 
requirements;  

(F) Adequate equipment shall be provided 
for on-site storing and serving of food;  

(G) Food items shall be covered properly 
or packaged and protected from contamina-
tion;  

(H) Food placed on the table family style 
shall be discarded if not eaten;  

(I) Food shall be thawed properly; and  
(J) Food shall be cooked, stored, and 

served at safe temperatures. Foods requiring 
hot storage shall have an internal temperature 
of one hundred forty degrees Fahrenheit 
(140°F) or above. Cool foods requiring 
refrigeration after preparation shall have an 
internal temperature of forty-one degrees 
Fahrenheit (41°F) or below.  

(10) Sanitation inspections of license-exempt 

facilities may be delegated to the Department 
of Health and Senior Services or local public 
health agencies if the standards employed for 
inspections are substantially equivalent to this 
rule. Fees, as provided for in section 
192.300, RSMo, may be charged at the 
option of the local public health agency.  

AUTHORITY: section 161.092, RSMo 2016, 
and section 210.252, RSMo Supp. 2021.* 
This rule was previously filed as 19 CSR 40-
60.090. Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, 
effective July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 
30-60.090 July 30, 1998. Emergency amend-
ment filed March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 
2000, expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed 
March 1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. 
Moved to 5 CSR 25-300.080, effective Aug. 
30, 2021. Amended: Filed Oct. 6, 2021, effec-
tive May 30, 2022. 

*Original authority: 161.092, RSMo 1963, amended 
1973, 2002, 2003, 2013, 2014, and 210.252, RSMo 1993, 
amended 1999, 2019, 2020, 2021. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.090 Physical Plant, Space, 
Supplies and Equipment 

PURPOSE: This rule sets forth the require-
ments for the physical plant, indoor and out-
door space, supplies and equipment for 
license-exempt child care facilities. 

(1) The premises of all facilities shall be safe 
and suitable for the care of children.  

(A) Children shall have no access to areas 
not approved for child care.  

(B) Porches, decks, stairwells or other 
areas in approved child care space shall have 
protective handrails and guardrails if there is 
a drop-off of more than twenty-four inches 
(24") from which children might fall and be 
injured. Guardrails shall be at least thirty-six 
inches (36") high, and shall have bars placed 
at intervals of no more than three and one-
half inches (3 1/2"), or have protective mate-
rial to prevent a three and one-half inch (3 
1/2") sphere from passing through the bars.  

(C) Approved safety gates at stairways and 
doors shall be provided as needed.  

(D) Hazardous materials such as cleaning 
supplies, poisonous materials, medicines, 
alcoholic beverages or hazardous personal 
care items shall be inaccessible to children 
and stored to prevent cross-contamination of 
food and food-related materials.  

(E) Ammunition, guns, hunting knives, 
bows and arrows, or other weapons shall not 
be on the premises unless stored in a locked 
cabinet or closet.  

(F) Walls, ceilings, floors and equipment 
shall be finished with materials that can be 
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cleaned easily and shall be free of splinters, 
cracks and chipped paint. Floor covering 
shall be in good condition. The facility shall 
be free of all lead hazards and asbestos that is 
friable or dangerous. 

(2) Indoor space requirements shall include: 
(A) Adequate artificial or natural lighting 

throughout each room used for child care;  
(B) Room temperatures that are no less 

than sixty-eight degrees Fahrenheit (68°F) 
and no more than eighty-five degrees 
Fahrenheit (85°F) measured two feet (2') 
from the floor;  

(C) A telephone in working order available 
for incoming and outgoing calls;  

(D) Police, fire department, poison con-
trol, ambulance and other emergency num-
bers posted near the telephone; 

(E) At least thirty-five (35) square feet of 
usable floor space for each preschool and 
school-age child, and at least forty-five (45) 
square feet of usable floor space for each 
infant/toddler.  

1. Floor space shall be measured wall-
to-wall from the inside walls of areas used for 
children’s activities.  

2. Floor space shall not include 
kitchens, bathrooms, closets, staff lounges, 
office space, hallways used exclusively as 
passageways and floor space occupied by fur-
niture or shelving not used for children or 
their activities.  

3. In a facility located in an owner’s per-
manent residence, the area used for child 
care, including play space and bathrooms, 
shall be separate from the family living quar-
ters unless the facility is providing care for 
ten (10) or fewer children; and 

(F) Facilities providing infant and toddler 
care shall meet the following requirements:  

1. The floor shall be covered with mate-
rial that can be cleaned. Carpets or rugs shall 
be spot-cleaned when soiled. They shall be 
sanitized with an approved sanitizer when 
contaminated with body fluids;  

2. A facility with a capacity of more 
than twenty (20) children or more than four 
(4) infants and toddlers shall have infant and 
toddler space separate from the older chil-
dren. The space shall be separated by floor-
to-ceiling walls with separate play, sleeping 
and bathroom space;  

3. No more than twenty-four (24) 
infants/toddlers shall be in a single room. A 
room is an area separated from other parts of 
the building by floor to ceiling walls. Stable 
partitions, a minimum of four feet (4') in 
height, shall be used to separate the 
infant/toddler and two (2)-year old groups 
within a room; and  

4. No more than eight (8) infant/toddlers 

or sixteen (16) two (2) year olds shall be in a 
group.  

(3) General requirements for bathrooms shall 
include: 

(A) One (1) flush toilet and one (1) adja-
cent handwashing facility with running water 
available for every twenty (20) children. 
Urinals may be substituted for up to one-half 
(1/2) the required number of toilets, with a 
minimum of one (1) toilet per bathroom;  

(B) Water temperatures at handwashing 
facilities accessible to children shall not 
exceed one hundred twenty degrees 
Fahrenheit (120°F);  

(C) Locks or latches shall not be used on 
bathroom or bathroom stall doors used by 
children below the first grade;  

(D) If a facility provides care for more than 
fifty (50) children, a separate bathroom or 
bathroom stall shall be available for care-
givers;  

(E) When a facility offers care for more 
than twenty (20) children, including school-
age children in first grade or above, bath-
rooms shall be provided as follows:  

1. Separate girls’ and boys’ bathrooms; 
or  

2. If twenty (20) or fewer school-age 
children are in care, one (1) bathroom may be 
designated for school-age children only; and 

(F) For infants, toddlers and children not 
toilet trained, one (1) flush toilet and one (1) 
adjacent handwashing facility with running 
water shall be available for every twenty-four 
(24) children in an infant/toddler unit. One 
(1) potty chair, junior commode or toilet with 
an adapter seat shall be provided for every 
four (4) children being toilet trained. 

(4) Outdoor space requirements shall include: 
(A) An outdoor play area available on or 

adjoining the child care property. Facilities 
with a capacity of more than ten (10) children 
shall have a fenced play area. Play areas in 
facilities with a capacity of ten (10) or fewer 
children shall be fenced when necessary for 
the protection of children from traffic, water 
or other hazards. Fences shall be at least 
forty-two inches (42") high. Openings in 
fences shall be no greater than three and one-
half inches (3 1/2");  

(B) A minimum of seventy-five (75) square 
feet per child of outdoor play area. A suffi-
cient area shall be available to accommodate 
one-third (1/3) the capacity of the facility at 
one (1) time with a minimum of seven hun-
dred fifty (750) square feet;  

(C) The play area shall be safe for chil-
dren’s activities. It shall be well-maintained 
and free of hazards such as poisonous plants, 
broken glass, barbed wire, open wells, rocks 

and other debris, and shall have good 
drainage;  

(D) The fall-zone area under and around 
outdoor equipment over twenty-four inches 
(24") high covered with impact-absorbing 
materials that will effectively cushion the fall 
of a child. Materials may include sand, pea 
gravel, tanbark, shredded tires, wood chips, 
rubber matting or other approved resilient 
material;  

(E) Outdoor play space for infants and tod-
dlers separate from that used for older chil-
dren, or the same space used at different 
times. This does not apply to facilities caring 
for a maximum of twenty (20) children, 
including no more than four (4) infant/tod-
dlers;  

(F) Swimming and wading pools used by 
children that are constructed, maintained and 
used in a manner that protects the health and 
safety of children.  

1. Swimming and wading pools shall be 
enclosed by a fence at least forty-two inches 
(42") high with a locked gate.  

2. Swimming and wading pools shall 
have a water filtration system. The water shall 
be treated, cleaned and maintained in a man-
ner approved by a state or local health author-
ity;  

(G) Outdoor equipment shall be safely 
constructed, in good condition, and free of 
sharp, loose or pointed parts. Stationary 
equipment such as swings, slides and 
climbers shall be anchored securely; and  

(H) Any part of outdoor equipment from 
which children might fall shall not exceed six 
feet (6') in height. 

(5) When children are napped on the premis-
es, indoor equipment requirements shall 
include: 

(A) An individual mat, cot or bed with an 
individually assigned sheet and blanket pro-
vided for each child who naps or sleeps. 
Upper levels of bunk beds shall not be used. 
If mats are used they shall have nonab-
sorbent, cleanable coverings and shall not be 
placed directly on concrete, linoleum, hard-
wood, or tile floors when children are resting 
or napping. They shall be used only over car-
peting and shall be long enough so the child’s 
head or feet do not rest off the mat. Mats 
shall be washed and sanitized at least weekly, 
or more often as needed, and shall be cleaned 
and sanitized before use by another child;  

(B) Clean bedding with sheets laundered at 
least once a week or when soiled. Once bed-
ding has been used by a child, it shall not be 
used by another child until it is laundered;  

(C) Sleeping equipment arranged to pro-
vide at least a two foot (2') aisle on one (1) 
long side of the equipment; and  



(D) An individually assigned crib, portable 
crib or playpen for each infant. Stack cribs 
shall not be used. Cots or mats may be used 
for napping for toddlers twelve (12) months 
and older with parental consent. Infants shall 
not use mats for napping.  

1. Cribs and playpens shall have side 
and end rail spokes not more than two and 
three-eighths inches (2 3/8") apart.  

2. The crib mattress or playpen pad 
shall be sized correctly to the crib or playpen. 
The pad shall be in good condition, water-
proof, clean and dry. Sheets and covers shall 
be changed when soiled or wet.  

(6) Individual seating and table space shall be 
available for children twelve (12) months of 
age and older.  

(A) Facilities shall have one (1) piece of 
mealtime feeding equipment for every four 
(4) infants/toddlers. 

(B) Equipment shall allow children to sit 
comfortably and securely while being fed. 
Appropriate restraints shall be used and 
infants shall not be left unattended.  

(C) Walkers shall not be used. 

(7) Indoor play equipment and materials shall 
be provided and shall be clean and in good 
condition with all parts intact. Infants and 
toddlers shall have safe toys. Toys, parts of 
toys or other materials small enough to be 
swallowed shall not be used.  

AUTHORITY: sections 210.221.1(3) and 
210.252.5, RSMo Supp. 1999.* This rule was 
previously filed as 19 CSR 40-60.100. 
Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, effective 
July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 30-60.100 
July 30, 1998. Emergency amendment filed 
March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 2000, 
expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed March 
1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. Moved to 5 
CSR 25-300.090, effective Aug. 30, 2021. 

*Original authority: 210.221, RSMo 1949, amended 1955, 
1987, 1993, 1995, 1999; 210.252, RSMo 1993, amended 
1999.. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.100 Transportation and 
Field Trip Requirements 
(Rescinded May 30, 2022) 

AUTHORITY: sections 210.221.1(3) and 
210.252.5, RSMo Supp. 1999. This rule was 
previously filed as 19 CSR 40-60.110. 
Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, effective 
July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 30-60.110 
July 30, 1998. Emergency amendment filed 
March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 2000, 
expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed March 
1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. Moved to 5 

CSR 25-300.100, effective Aug. 30, 2021. 
Rescinded: Filed Oct. 6, 2021, effective May 
30, 2022. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.110 Admission Procedures 
and Required Reports and Records 

PURPOSE: This rule establishes admission 
procedures, records and reports facility direc-
tors are required to keep for children and 
caregivers. 

(1) The facility director shall have an admit-
ting procedure for each child in care that 
includes a plan for caring for the child if s/he 
becomes ill or needs emergency medical 
treatment. The director shall maintain an 
individual file on each child in order to com-
municate with the parent(s), guardian or legal 
custodian. The director shall have a plan for 
any child with special health needs, identified 
through a physical assessment by a licensed 
physician or an advance practice nurse, to 
ensure that those needs are met during care.  

(2) The facility director shall obtain and file 
the following written information on each 
child:  

(A) The child’s full name, address, birth-
date and the date care begins and ends;  

(B) The full name of the parent(s), 
guardian or legal custodian, home address, 
work schedule, home and work telephone 
numbers, and employer’s name and address;  

(C) Full name, address and phone number 
of a friend or relative who might be reached 
in an emergency when a parent, guardian or 
legal custodian can not be reached;  

(D) Name and phone number of a physi-
cian and preferred hospital to be used in an 
emergency;  

(E) The name of the individual(s) autho-
rized to take the child from the premises; and  

(F) Information concerning any accident or 
injury to a child while in care or any emer-
gency medical care given.  

(3) Individual records of a child shall be 
retained for one (1) year after the child dis-
continues attendance.  

(4) Facility directors, shall obtain and file the 
following acknowledgments by a parent of 
each child:  

(A) S/he has been informed of the required 
health and safety inspections and that the 
inspection forms are available for review; and  

(B) S/he understands and agrees that the 
child may not be accepted for care when ill.  

(5) A copy of the completed application for 
child abuse/neglect screening shall be on file 

in each employee’s record.  

(6) All enrollment records, physical assess-
ment reports and attendance records shall be 
filed in a place known to caregivers and shall 
be accessible during normal visiting hours for 
inspection by the department. Records shall 
not be in a locked area or removed from the 
premises during operating hours. 

AUTHORITY: sections 210.221.1(3) and 
210.252.5, RSMo Supp. 1999.* This rule was 
previously filed as 19 CSR 40-60.120. 
Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, effective 
July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 30-60.120 
July 30, 1998. Emergency amendment filed 
March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 2000, 
expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed March 
1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. Moved to 5 
CSR 25-300.110, effective Aug. 30, 2021. 

*Original authority: 210.221, RSMo 1949, amended 1955, 
1987, 1993, 1995, 1999; 210.252, RSMo 1993, amended 
1999. 
 
 
5 CSR 25-300.120 Variance Requests 

PURPOSE: This rule establishes the proce-
dure for a facility director to request a vari-
ance from any portion of the rules of this 
chapter. 

(1) Any facility owner or designee may 
request a variance from a rule. The request 
for a variance shall be submitted in writing to 
the department and shall include the rule(s) 
for which a variance is requested and the rea-
son(s) for the request. The department shall 
approve any variance request that does not 
endanger the health or safety of the children 
served by the facility. Local inspectors may 
grant a variance, subject to approval by the 
department.  

(2) If a variance request is not approved by the 
department, the facility owner or designee 
shall be advised in writing of the basis for the 
denial. The facility owner or designee may 
request a review of the decision by the 
Commissioner of Education (commissioner) 
of the department or designee within thirty 
(30) calendar days of receipt of notification of 
the denial. The commissioner or designee 
shall have fifteen (15) business days to make 
the final determination on the variance 
request. That determination is subject to 
Chapter 536, RSMo, review for license-
exempt facilities. 

AUTHORITY: section 161.092, RSMo 2016, 
and section 210.252, RSMo Supp. 2021.* 
This rule was previously filed as 19 CSR 40-
60.040. Original rule filed Dec. 1, 1994, 
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effective July 30, 1995. Changed to 19 CSR 
30-60.040 July 30, 1998. Emergency amend-
ment filed March 1, 2000, effective March 11, 
2000, expired Sept. 6, 2000. Amended: Filed 
March 1, 2000, effective Aug. 30, 2000. 
Moved to 5 CSR 25-300.120, effective Aug. 
30, 2021. Amended: Filed Oct. 6, 2021, effec-
tive May 30, 2022. 

*Original authority: 161.092, RSMo 1963, amended 
1973, 2002, 2003, 2013, 2014, and 210.252, RSMo 1993, 
amended 1999, 2019, 2020, 2021. 
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